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Abstract 
 
Every company always expects its employees to have achievements, because 

having employees who excel will make an optimal contribution to the company. In 
addition, by having employees who excel the company can improve the company's 
performance. The purpose of this study was to determine the effect of education level on 
employee performance and work experience on employee performance at the Bandung 
branch of BRI Syariah bank. The sampling method used is a saturated sample so that 
the sample used is 47 respondents. The statistical method used is multiple regression 
analysis. The results showed that the level of education and work experience partially 
had a significant effect on employee performance, and was able to contribute to 
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employee performance by 84.3% while the rest was influenced by other variables not 
examined in this study. 

Keywords: education level, work experience, employee performance 
 

INTRODUCTION 
 
Every company requires maximum profit, in achieving maximum results the company 

requires high productivity and loyalty from the elements engaged in it, thus the continuity 
of the company can be guaranteed and can develop all forms of business. Every 
organisation constantly expects its employees to have achievements, because having 
personnel who excel will make an optimal contribution to the enterprise. further, by way 
of having personnel who excel the company can enhance the enterprise's performance. 
In different phrases, the continuity of a company is decided via the overall performance 
of its personnel. in keeping with [1]overall performance is a function of motivation and 
ability to complete a mission or process a person ought to have a certain degree of 
willingness and level of potential. Efforts to improve employee performance, including by 
paying attention to the level of education. In carrying out the work, employees also are 
inseparable from the extent of education they have. in addition, work experience is also 
very important for personnel to enhance their performance. According to [2]. “Work 
experience is the length of time an employee has worked in the workplace from the time 
he was accepted into the workplace until now. 

The education and work experience of employees is one of the factors in determining 
the level of employee performance. With education and work experience, it is hoped that 
it will produce quality human resources and be able to provide the best results in 
achieving company goals. For the manifestation of the workforce development function, 
the human resources of the organization must be provided with education, work 
experience and other human resource development factors. Educational and work 
experience programs are a continuous process due to the emergence of conditions for 
both technological developments, economic and non-economic developments within the 
company. 

Basically, the company not only expects employees who are capable, capable, and 
skilled, but most importantly they can work hard and are willing to achieve optimal work 
results. The abilities, skills, and skills of employees will be in vain if they do not have a 
hard working attitude. Organizational leaders must know what kind of workforce can 
devote themselves to the organization. In terms of employee recruitment, the company 
must be really careful in implementing the selection of employees who will be accepted 
and employed in the company. It is assumed that the higher a person's level of 
education, the more knowledge and insight they have. And if then supported by a lot of 
work experience, the employee already has a plus value from the company's 
assessment. Because by having a work experience in a certain field, it is sufficient to 
provide an assessment that the workforce has often heard or done the work so that 
there is no awkwardness in carrying out their responsibilities. 

Based on the identification at the Bandung branch of BRI Syariah Bank, namely the 
weak knowledge of employees (supervisors) in making daily work plans to be carried out 
due to the limited level of employee education, and the lack of employee work 
experience. This is evident because many employees make mistakes when doing daily 
work, especially work related to other units. 

Based totally on the above, the formulation of the trouble on this have a look at is: 
1. How is the effect of education level on employee performance at BRI 

Syariah Bandung branch? 
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2. How does work experience affect employee performance at BRI Syariah 
Bandung branch? 

 
LITERATURE REVIEW 
 
Level of education 
 
 [3] education level is the stage of continuous education, which is determined based 

on the level of development of students, the level of complexity of teaching materials and 
the way in which teaching materials are presented. In line with the opinion of [4] states 
that the level of education is an activity of a person in developing abilities, attitudes, and 
forms of behavior, both for life in the future where through certain organizations or not 
organized. according to [5], the dimensions of the level of education are (1) formal 
education with indicators of education obtained at school, and (2) non-formal education 
with indicators of training that has been attended by workers. In line with this view, 
[6]explains the dimensions and indicators of education level include (1) the dimension of 
formal education with the indicator being the last education completed by each worker 
which includes elementary, junior high, high school and college, and (2) the dimension of 
informal education. with indicators of attitude and personality formed from family and 
environment. [7]. "Work experience is the length of time an employee has worked in the 
workplace from the time he was accepted into the workplace until now". Agree with [8, 9] 
stated as follows. "Work experience is the period of time or length of time a person 
works in an organization". Referring to the opinion of [8], work experience is based on 
the period of service or the length of time the employee has worked. [10, 11]states that 
the dimensions of work experience can be seen from the length of time or tenure, the 
level of knowledge and skills possessed, and the type of work. 

 
Work experience 
 
 A person's work experience shows the types of work that a person has done and 

provides a great opportunity for someone to do a better job. The wider a person's work 
experience, the more skilled he is at doing the work and the more perfect the pattern of 
thinking and attitude in acting to achieve the goals that have been set [12]. An 
applicant's work experience should be the main consideration in the selection process. 
Experienced people are prospective employees who are ready to use [13]. According to 
[13] explains there are several things to determine whether employees are experienced 
or not and as well as an indicator of work experience is the length of time or hours of 
work, level of intellect and skills, mastery of work and equipment. 

 
Performance 
  
Performance appraisal plays a very important role in increasing work motivation in 

the workplace. Employees want and need feedback regarding their performance and 
appraisals provide an opportunity to provide them with feedback. If the employee's 
performance is not up to standard, then the assessment provides an opportunity to 
review the employee's progress and to develop an employee performance improvement 
plan. According to performance appraisal is an attempt to plan and control the work 
management process so that it can be carried out according to the goals that have been 
set, work performance appraisal is also a process of evaluating and assessing employee 
performance in the past or to predict future work performance in an organization [14]. 



 

 

  4681  

Volume 23 Issue 1 2022      CENTRAL ASIA AND THE CAUCASUS      English Edition 

 

 As for the indicators of employee performance in this study, namely punctuality, a 
certain type of work requires attendance in doing it according to the specified time. 
Quality, every worker recognizes and solves relevant problems and has a positive work 
attitude in the workplace. Good employee performance is very important for the progress 
of the company. Quantity, a person can complete his work in a predetermined time 
period. 

The research hypotheses are: 
Hypothesis 1: There is a significant effect of education level on employee performance 

Hypothesis 2: There is a significant effect of work experience on employee 
performance 

 
RESEARCH METHODOLOGY 
 
The research method to be carried out is quantitative. Where research is based on 

the philosophy of positivism, which is used to examine certain populations or samples 
with random sampling techniques, for data collection using research instruments, 
namely questionnaires, while data analysis is quantitative/statistical which aims to test 
predetermined hypotheses [15]. The type of research used is an associative explanatory 
research. Where the research aims to determine the relationship between two or more 
variables. While the unit of analysis in this study is the employees of Bank BRI Syariah 
Bandung Branch. 

The population included in this study were 47 employees. While the sampling 
technique of this research is the saturated sample technique, that is, all the population is 
sampled. So the number of samples is the same as the research population of 47 
employees. The collection of data that has been taken is based on sources, namely 
there are primary sources and secondary sources [16, 17]. Primary sources are taken 
from the data taken which has been obtained through observations, questionnaires, and 
interviews. The secondary data sources were obtained but not taken directly through 
media related to the company or other parties [18, 19]. statistical processing method 
using multiple linear regression method using software (SPSS). Data processing with 
SPSS application produces outputs in the form of normality, correlation, linearity, 
multiple linear regression values. 

 
RESULTS AND DISCUSSION 
 
Based on the data collected, it is known that respondents for gender characteristics, 

the majority of employees of Bank BRI Syariah Bandung branch in this study were male 
as many as 45 respondents (96%). Furthermore, for the age that dominates at the age 
of 31-43 years as many as 28 respondents (60%) while the characteristics of the last 
education, the majority of employees have a bachelor's degree as many as 26 
respondents (55%) and for the majority of years of service 0-5 years as many as 20 
respondents (42 %). 

 
Data Normality Test 
 
Normality test is used in statistics to determine whether a population is normally 

distributed or not. Data that is considered normal if the data is in a curve with a slope of 
the left and right sides, and is not skewed to the left or right, but to the center with a bell-
like shape with close to zero. Based on the results of processing on SPSS on the data 
obtained, it can be seen as shown below: 
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T a b l e  1  

Multicollinearity test 

 
 
 
 
 

 

 
Figure 1. Histogram to test the normality of the data 
Source: SPSS Version 23.0 data processing; 2021 

In the picture above, the variable data used will be declared normally distributed. 
This happens because the residual point comes from data with a normal distribution and 
follows a diagonal line or a linear line. Thus, it can be concluded that the regression has 
met normality. 

 
Multicollinearity Test 

 
Multicollinearity test was conducted to determine whether there was a correlation or 

relationship between independent variables in the regression model. To find out whether 
or not there is multicollinearity, that is by looking at the Variance Inflation Factor (VIF). If 
the VIF value is not more than 10, then multicollinearity occurs. This can be seen from: 
 
  
 

 
 

Model 1 
 

 
Unstandardized 

Coefficients 
 

 
Standardized 
Coefficients 

 

 
 
 

T 

 
 

Sig. 

 
Collinearity  

Statistics  

B Std. 
Error 

Beta Zero 
order 

Partial 

Constant 9.025 3.739  2.414 .020   

Tingkat 
pandidikan 

.502 .105 .490 4.762 .000 .620 1.612 

Pengalaman kerja .438 .101 .448 4.354 .000 .620 1.612 

 
  

Based on the results of the calculations in the table above, the tolerance value 
shows that none of the independent variables has a VIF value of more than 10 and the 
tolerance value has no value less than 0.1. so it can be concluded that there is no 
multicollinearity between the level of education and work experience. 

 
Heteroscedasticity Test 
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Heteroscedasticity is a condition where the variance of the confounding error is not 

constant for all values of the independent variables, where this test aims to test whether 
in the regression model there is an inequality of variance from the residual or one other 
observation. To detect it, look at the points that spread above and below the number 0 
on the axis of the Scatterplot graph. The following are the results of the 
heteroscedasticity test observations 

 

 
Figure 1. heteroscedasticity test results 

 
From the results of the heteroscedasticity test, it shows that the distribution of 

residual data does not form a certain pattern and spreads below and above zero on the 
axis of the scatterplot graph, thus the model is free from heteroscedasticity symptoms. 

 
Multiple Linear Regression Analysis 
 
The analytical model used in this study is multiple regression analysis. Multiple 

regression analysis serves to determine the effect of the level of education and work 
experience on employee performance at the Bandung branch of BRI Syariah bank. 
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T a b l e  2  

Multiple Regression output 

 
 
 
 
 

 

T a b l e  3  

Model Summary 
 
 
 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 

 
 

Model 1 
 

 
Unstandardized 

Coefficients 
 

 
Standardized 
Coefficients 

 

 
 
 

T 

 
 

Sig. 

B Std. 
Error 

Beta 

Constant 9.025 3.739  2.414 .020 

Tingkat 
pandidikan 

.502 .105 .490 4.762 .000 

Pengalaman kerja .438 .101 .448 4.354 .000 

 
Based on the results shown in the table above, the multiple regression equation 

model is obtained as follows: 
Y = 9.025 + 0.502X1 + 0.438 X2 + e 
 
Coefficient of Determination 
 
The coefficient of determination (R2) generated from the structural equation model 

to express the magnitude of the influence given to the dependent variable from the 
independent variables associated with the respective influence paths shows the 
following results. 
 
 
 

 
Model 

 
R 

R 
Square 

Adjusted 
R  

square 

Std. Error of 
the  

Estimate 
1 .843 .711 .698 2.897 

 
  Source: Processed primary data 

 
The results of the above calculation show that in this model the variables of 

education level and work experience together have an effect on employee performance 
of 84.3%. This means that the proportion of influence given by exogenous variables to 
endogenous variables in this study contributes to the influence of 84.3% while the 
remaining 15.3% is influenced by other factors. 

 
F Model Testing 
 
According to [20, 21]the goodness of fit test is carried out to measure the accuracy of 

the sample regression function in estimating the actual value statistically. The goodness 
of fit model can be measured from the statistical value of F which indicates whether all 
the independent variables included in the model have a joint influence on the dependent 
variable. 
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 T a b l e  4  

Anova 
 
 
 
 

 

T a b l e  5  

coefficients 
 
 
 
 

 

 
 

 
Model 1 

 
Sum of 
Square 

 
df 

 
Mean Square 

 
F 

 
Sig. 

Regression 908,899 2 454,449 54.143 0.000b 

Residual 369,314 44 .8,393   

Total 1278,213 46    

 
Based on the ANOVA table above, a significance of 0.000 can be obtained where the 
number is <0.05, so that the hypothesis is accepted, which means it shows that the test 
model is feasible to be used in research. 
 

T Uji test 
 
The t-test was conducted to determine the effect of education level and work 

experience partially on employee performance, which was tested at a significant level of 
0.05 with the basis for making decisions by looking at the comparison value between 
t_test > t_table so that the hypothesis can be accepted. 

 
 
 

 
 

Model 1 
 

 
Unstandardized 

Coefficients 
 

 
Standardized 
Coefficients 

 

 
 
 

T 

 
 

Sig. 

B Std. 
Error 

Beta 

Constant 9.025 3.739  2.414 .020 

Tingkat 
pandidikan 

.502 .105 .490 4.762 .000 

kerja Pengalaman  .438 .101 .448 4.354 .000 

 
 

Based on the results above, the education level has a t count of 4.762 which is 
greater than a t table of 1,680 so it can be concluded that the hypothesis is accepted, 
meaning that the level of education has a significant positive effect on employee 
performance, as well as work experience has a t_test of 4,354 > t_table of 1,680 so it 
can be concluded that the hypothesis is accepted, meaning that work experience has a 
significant positive effect on employee performance. 

 
The effect of education level on employee performance 
 
Based on the results of the study, it is known that the influence between the level of 

education has (p = 0.000<0.05) then Ho is rejected and Ha is accepted, meaning that 
there is a positive influence between the level of education on employee performance. In 
this case, it can be seen that the employees of the BRI sharia bank in Bandung branch 
have a majority education level of Bachelor (S1), this of course provides good benefits 
for the company, of course, the basic concept of education in my opinion [22, 23] 
education as a activity means an effort that is consciously designed to help a person or 
group of people in developing knowledge, outlook on life, attitude to life, and life skills 
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both individually. and socially.  
Type of education is education that is grouped according to the nature and specificity of 
its objectives. The types of education included in the school education pathway consist 
of general education, vocational education, special education, official education, 
religious education, academic education and professional education [24]. This finding 
supports the theory of [25]which states that a person's level of education will affect 
employee performance. [26]also states that a high level of education of employees will 
affect the ability to achieve optimal performance. Empirical studies that also support the 
findings of this study are the results of research conducted by [27, 28] which states that 
the level of education has a significant effect on employee performance.  

 
Effect of work experience on employee performance 
 
 Based on the results of the study, it is known that the influence between work 

experience and employee performance has a value (p = 0.000 < 0.05), then Ho is 
rejected and Ha is accepted, meaning that there is a positive influence between work 
experience and employee performance. Work experience is a huge potential to do work 
effectively, because a person does not have sufficient educational background or the 
skills he has also determine the ability of each person to adapt to differences and 
environmental changes, both internally and externally [29]. Work experience is usually in 
the form of knowledge and skills that take place within a certain time where a person is 
involved in an activity. Work experience that forms work skills is very dependent on a 
person's willingness to have the skills so that a job can be completed on time and with 
quality. 

The results of this study are in accordance with the theory of [30] which states that if 
employees have knowledge and skills that are in accordance with their work, the 
employee's performance will be higher. The longer the work experience possessed by 
the employee, the higher the work results to be achieved. The results of this study are in 
accordance with an empirical study from [29] which states that work experience has a 
significant influence on employee performance. 

 
CONCLUSIONS AND SUGGESTIONS 
 
Conclusion 
 
Based on the results of the study, it can be concluded that the level of education and 

work experience partially has a positive influence on employee performance at the 
Bandung branch of BRI Syariah bank, and both simultaneously have an effect of 84.3%. 
This shows empirically the level of education and work experience are factors that need 
to be developed in achieving a company goal. 

 
Suggestion 
 

The suggestions that researchers can express in this study are: 
For the Bandung branch of BRI sharia bank, it can develop employee performance 

through the level of education by providing opportunities for employees to be able to 
continue to a higher level of education by balancing the position, work experience and 
compensation that will be obtained. In addition, it appears that there are other factors 
(independent variables) outside of this study, so it will be more accurate and give a 
positive value if other relevant variables are added. 
 



 

 

  4687  

Volume 23 Issue 1 2022      CENTRAL ASIA AND THE CAUCASUS      English Edition 

 

REFERENCES 
 
1. Millette, V. and M. Gagné, Designing volunteers’ tasks to maximize motivation, satisfaction and 

performance: The impact of job characteristics on volunteer engagement. Motivation and emotion, 

2008. 32(1): p. 11-22.DOI: https://doi.org/10.1007/s11031-007-9079-4. 

2. Martoyo, S., Human Resource Management, 5th Edition, First Printing. Yogyakarta: BPFE, 2007. 

3. Yahdi, M., INQUIRY LEARNING STRATEGIES. Jurnal Inspiratif Pendidikan. 5(2): p. 342-350. 

4. Sharipov, S. and G. Rakhimova, Successive development of the creative person in the continuous 

education. Mental Enlightenment Scientific-Methodological Journal, 2021. 2021(4): p. 1-7. 

5. Kalediene, R., S. Starkuviene, and J. Petrauskiene, Social dimensions of mortality from external causes 

in Lithuania: do education and place of residence matter? Sozial-und Präventivmedizin, 2006. 51(4): 

p. 232-239.DOI: https://doi.org/10.1007/s00038-006-4069-y. 
6. Kristensen, H.S. and M.A. Mosgaard, A review of micro level indicators for a circular economy–

moving away from the three dimensions of sustainability? Journal of Cleaner Production, 2020. 243: p. 

118531.DOI: https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jclepro.2019.118531. 

7. Onsøyen, L.E., R.J. Mykletun, and T.J. Steiro, Silenced and invisible: The work‐experience of room‐

attendants in Norwegian hotels. Scandinavian Journal of Hospitality and Tourism, 2009. 9(1): p. 81-

102.DOI: https://doi.org/10.1080/15022250902761462. 

8. Lillard, L.A., Job turnover heterogeneity and person-job-specific time-series wages. Annales 

d'Economie et de Statistique, 1999: p. 183-210.DOI: https://doi.org/10.2307/20076196. 

9. Sengodan, V.C., N. Thiagarajan, and I.P. Raajendiren, Evaluating the efficacy of platelet rich plasma 

injection for the treatment of chronic plantar fasciitis. Journal of Natural Science, Biology and 

Medicine, 2020. 11(2): p. 135. 
10. Tesluk, P.E. and R.R. Jacobs, Toward an integrated model of work experience. Personnel psychology, 

1998. 51(2): p. 321-355.DOI: https://doi.org/10.1111/j.1744-6570.1998.tb00728.x. 

11. Sengodan, S.V.C., V. Arun, and S. Arun, Vetrivel trauma score–An evidence-based scoring system to 

predict limb salvage and outcomes in gustilo anderson grade III B and C compound fractures of lower 

extremities. Journal of Natural Science, Biology and Medicine, 2020. 11(2): p. 151. 

12. Guile, D. and T. Griffiths, Learning through work experience. Journal of education and work, 2001. 

14(1): p. 113-131.DOI: https://doi.org/10.1080/13639080020028738. 

13. Dreher, G.F. and K.C. Ryan, A suspect MBA selection model: The case against the standard work 

experience requirement. Academy of Management Learning & Education, 2004. 3(1): p. 87-91.DOI: 

https://doi.org/10.5465/amle.2004.12436822. 

14. Cravens, K.S., et al., Workplace culture mediates performance appraisal effectiveness and employee 

outcomes: A study in a retail setting. Journal of Management Accounting Research, 2015. 27(2): p. 1-
34.DOI: https://doi.org/10.2308/jmar-51169. 

15. Farghaly, A., Comparing and Contrasting Quantitative and Qualitative Research Approaches in 

Education: The Peculiar Situation of Medical Education. Education in Medicine Journal, 2018. 

10(1).DOI: https://doi.org/10.21315/eimj2018.10.1.2. 

16. Heckathorn, D.D., Respondent-driven sampling: a new approach to the study of hidden populations. 

Social problems, 1997. 44(2): p. 174-199.DOI: https://doi.org/10.1525/sp.1997.44.2.03x0221m. 

17. Sengupta, P., A. Sharma, and N. Das, Is there any benefit of integrating computer-assisted learning 

with conventional teaching format in pharmacology to demonstrate the effects of different drugs on 

mean arterial blood pressure in an anesthetized dog?: A comparative study. Journal of natural science, 

biology, and medicine, 2017. 8(2): p. 181. 

18. Indriantoro, N., Alternative Schools of Thought in Accounting. Indonesian Journal of Economics and 
Business, 1999. 14(3). 

19. Suryarao, P.S., et al., Comparison between oral health status of institutionalised and home stay 

disabled children in western Maharashtra region. Journal of Natural Science, Biology and Medicine, 

2020. 11(2): p. 179. 

20. Smith, E.P. and K.A. Rose, Model goodness-of-fit analysis using regression and related techniques. 

Ecological modelling, 1995. 77(1): p. 49-64.DOI: https://doi.org/10.1016/0304-3800(93)E0074-D. 

21. Susanto, A.D., et al., The prevalence and related risk factors of obstructive sleep apnea in heart failure 

patients at the indonesian referral hospital for respiratory diseases. Journal of Natural Science, 

Biology and Medicine, 2020. 11(2): p. 164. 

https://doi.org/10.1007/s11031-007-9079-4
https://doi.org/10.1007/s00038-006-4069-y
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jclepro.2019.118531
https://doi.org/10.1080/15022250902761462
https://doi.org/10.2307/20076196
https://doi.org/10.1111/j.1744-6570.1998.tb00728.x
https://doi.org/10.1080/13639080020028738
https://doi.org/10.5465/amle.2004.12436822
https://doi.org/10.2308/jmar-51169
https://doi.org/10.21315/eimj2018.10.1.2
https://doi.org/10.1525/sp.1997.44.2.03x0221m
https://doi.org/10.1016/0304-3800(93)E0074-D


 

 

  4688  

Volume 23 Issue 1 2022      CENTRAL ASIA AND THE CAUCASUS      English Edition 

 
22. Decramer, A., C. Smolders, and A. Vanderstraeten, Employee performance management culture and 

system features in higher education: relationship with employee performance management 

satisfaction. The International Journal of Human Resource Management, 2013. 24(2): p. 352-371.DOI: 

https://doi.org/10.1080/09585192.2012.680602. 

23. Asim, M., Impact of motivation on employee performance with effect of training: Specific to education 
sector of Pakistan. International journal of scientific and research publications, 2013. 3(9): p. 1-9. 

24. Eliyanto, E. and U.B. Wibowo, The influence of education level, training, and teaching experience on 

the professionalism of Muhammadiyah high school teachers in Kebumen district. Jurnal Akuntabilitas 

Manajemen Pendidikan, 2013. 1(1): p. 34-47.DOI: https://doi.org/10.21831/amp.v1i1.2321. 

25. Mamahit, R., Level of Education, Training and Job Satisfaction Influence on Employee Performance 

at the Disaster Management Agency of North Sulawesi Province. EMBA Journal: Journal of Economic 

Research, Management, Business and Accounting, 2013. 1(4). 

26. Osibanjo, A.O., et al., Compensation packages: a strategic tool for employees’ performance and 

retention. Leonardo Journal of Sciences, 2014. 25: p. 65-84. 

27. Kotteeswari, M. and S.T. Sharief, Job stress and its impact on employees performance a study with 

reference to employees working in Bpos. International Journal of Business and Administration 

Research Review, 2014. 2(4): p. 18-25. 
28. You, S.-H., M.-Y. Yoon, and J.-S. Moon, Antioxidant and Anti-inflammatory Activity Study of Fulvic 

Acid. Journal of Natural Science, Biology and Medicine, 2021. 12(3). 

29. Rozi, A. and D. Sunarsi, The Influence of Motivation and Work Experience on Employee Performance 

at PT. Yamaha Saka Motor in South Tangerang. Jurnal Office, 2020. 5(2): p. 65-74.DOI: 

https://doi.org/10.26858/jo.v5i2.13378. 

30. Purnama, C., Islamic culture impact of increasing satisfaction and performance of employees: Study of 

educational institutions Sabillilah Sampang. Asian Economic and Financial Review, 2017. 7(5): p. 

528-540.DOI: https://doi.org/10.18488/journal.aefr.2017.75.528.540. 

 

https://doi.org/10.1080/09585192.2012.680602
https://doi.org/10.21831/amp.v1i1.2321
https://doi.org/10.26858/jo.v5i2.13378
https://doi.org/10.18488/journal.aefr.2017.75.528.540

	INTRODUCTION
	In the picture above, the variable data used will be declared normally distributed. This happens because the residual point comes from data with a normal distribution and follows a diagonal line or a linear line. Thus, it can be concluded that the reg...
	Multicollinearity Test

